


Product Category Product Description Size Unit Pricing Unit Pricing Unit Pricing Unit Pricing Unit Pricing Unit Pricing

IV Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters 16 Gauge x 1.16" $108.33 $2.46/EA $2.14 $1.36 $102.50 $2.35

IV Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters 18 Gauge x 1.16" $102.78 $1.88/EA $2.03 $1.36 $102.50 $1.70

IV Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters 20 Gauge x 1.16" $102.78 $1.88/EA $2.03 $1.36 $102.50 $1.70

IV Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters 22 Gauge x 1" $102.78 $1.88/EA $2.03 $272.00 $102.50 $1.70

IV Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters 24 Gauge x .75" $102.78 $1.88/EA $2.03 $272.00 $102.50 $1.70

IV Sodium Chloride 0.9% IV Bag 1000ml Bag $2.52 $4.92/EA No Bid $5.21 $4.21 $3.35

IV Sodium Chloride 0.9% IV Bag 500 ml bag $2.52 $4.18/EA No Bid $4.67 $3.62 $5.25

IV Sodium Chloride 0.9% IV Bag 250ml Bag $2.52 $3.85/EA No Bid $4.80 $3.38 $6.45

IV Sodium Chloride 0.9% 500ml Bottle $1.52 $2.19/EA $1.57 $5.08 $1.91 $1.10

IV Sodium Chloride 0.9% 10ml flushes $46.28 $1.70/EA $28.94 $40.50 $32.00 $0.35

IV Padded IV Boards 3" x 9" $1.00 $0.95/EA $0.51 $0.46 $0.79 $0.81

IV Padded IV Boards 3" x 18" $4.81 $0.89/EA $0.68 $0.78 $1.08 $0.78

IV Tourniquiets - Latex-free $1.00 $7.45/BG $16.60 $18.70 $8.00 $34.90

IV Alcohol IV Prep Pads Medium $1.30 $1.63/BX $1.26 $1.80 $2.00 $1.37

IV Infusurg-Disposible 500ml No bid $15.16/EA $7.70 $16.25 $66.35 $14.90

IV Infusurg-Disposible 1000ml $16.46 $14.15/EA $8.21 $16.25 $10.35 $15.15

IV Luer slip tip syringe W/ Needle 1cc TB 25g x 5/8" $10.39 $0.09/EA $8.29 $0.17 $4.00 $8.50

IV Luer lock syringe 3cc $6.56 $0.05/EA $4.17 $0.09 $3.00 $5.55

IV Luer lock syringe 5-6cc $10.83 $0.08/EA $5.75 $0.16 $4.00 $10.50

IV Luer lock syringe 10-12cc $12.50 $0.09/EA $5.75 $0.20 $5.00 $11.55

IV Luer lock syringe 20-25cc $12.67 $0.24/EA $8.00 $0.34 $3.00 $14.80

IV Luer lock syringe 60cc $12.39 $12.38/BX $8.50 $0.70 $6.50 $11.65

IV Hypodermic Syringe Needles 18G x 1" $3.28 $8.89/BX $2.77 $0.10 $2.00 $3.40

IV Hypodermic Syringe Needles 22G x 1.5" $3.28 $8.89/BX $2.77 $0.10 $4.00 $3.40

IV Hypodermic Syringe Needles 25G x 1.5" $3.28 $8.89/BX $2.77 $0.09 $2.00 $3.40

IV Tegaderm transparent dressing 2 3/8" x 2 3/4" $38.79 $43.38/BX $21.88 $43.00 $15.00 $30.00

IV Lg Tegaderm dressing 4" x 5" $61.48 $66.66/BX $23.38 $68.15 $14.00 $31.50

IV Carpujet Injector No bid $0.02/EA $0.02 $0.03 $0.05 $0.02

IV Filter Straws No bid $0.45/EA $37.72 $0.75 $0.43 $0.42

IV 8" IV Extention w/ clave port 8" No bid $1.22/EA $0.88 $1.18 $111.00 $1.10

IV Selec-3 IV system No bid $5.99/EA $298.96 $5.42 $5.57 $267.85

IV EZ- IO 45mm  15ga Needle set No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid - No Bid

IV EZ-IO 25mm  15ga Needle set No bid $88.88/EA No Bid No Bid - No Bid

IV EZ-IO 15mm  15ga Needle set No bid $88.88/EA No Bid No Bid - No Bid

IV EZ-IO EZ-Stabilizer No bid $0.00/EA No Bid No Bid - No Bid

IV Y-Type blood tubing $4.34 $69.26/CS $108.88 No Bid $296.16 $2.70

Meds Adenocard/Adenosine Pre-filled 6mg luer lock $19.71 $18.11/EA No Bid $16.90 - $17.90

Meds Adenocard/Adenosine Pre-filled 12mg luer lock $32.02 $27.89/EA No Bid $26.50 $1,040.30 $26.95

Meds Albuterol Sulfate 3ml unit dose vial $3.30 $3.13/BX No Bid $4.00 $2.75 $3.27

Meds Amiodarone/Cordarone Pre-filled 150mg luer lock No bid $10.39/EA No Bid $9.80 $90.30 No Bid
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Meds Atropine sulfate Pre-filled 1mg luer lock $9.71 $11.44/EA No Bid $10.20 $36.77 $12.00

Meds Benadryl/Diphehydramine 50mg vial $23.94 $1.01/EA No Bid $1.08 $60.40 $1.05

Meds Calcium Chloride 1000mg vial No bid $10.89/EA No Bid No Bid $34.13 $11.70

Meds Cardizem/Diltiazem 25mg vial $21.59 $2.15/EA No Bid $29.80 $57.80 $2.25

Meds D-10 Pre mixed $2.40 $6.49/EA No Bid $4.80 $617.04 $6.55

Meds 25% Dextrose Pre-filled 2.5mg luer lock $8.56 $9.61/EA No Bid $8.40 $30.73 $9.50

Meds 50% Dextrose Pre-filled 25mg luer lock $8.20 $8.98/EA No Bid $7.90 $29.49 $13.00

Meds Dopamine HCL / 5% Dextrose 250ml IV Bag- 400mg $12.45 $13.21/EA No Bid $14.80 $790.02 $13.30

Meds DuoNeb Inhalation solution 3ml unit dose vial $3.30 $0.38/EA No Bid $9.50 - $0.38

Meds Epinephrine 1:1000 1mg ampules $12.75 $12.99/EA No Bid $118.00 $410.10 $13.00

Meds Epinephrine 1:10,000 Pre-filled 1mg luer lock $9.71 $7.85/EA No Bid $5.10 $173.20 $20.00

Meds Glutose 15 Single dose $10.32 $3.65/PK $3.21 $4.20 $10.02 $4.10

Meds Glucagon Two part vials $200.00 $192.18/EA No Bid $179.00 $1,106.77 $182.00

Meds Labetalol 100mg vial $3.47 $3.74/EA No Bid $3.95 $11.80 $3.90

Meds Lidocaine HCL / 5% dextrose 2gram 0.8% 250ml bag No bid $8.45/EA No Bid $6.45 $485.04 $8.80

Meds Lidocaine HCL 2% Pre-filled 100mg luer lock $3.07 $3.06/EA No Bid $3.30 $11.24 $3.30

Meds Magnesium sulfate 50% 1gram vial $1.91 $2.02/EA No Bid $2.15 $488.00 $2.15

Meds Nalaxone/Narcan Pre-filled 2mg luer lock $36.76 $35.58/EA No Bid $38.50 $127.72 $39.50

Meds Nitroglycerine tablets 0.4mg sl tablets $133.99 $32.51/BT No Bid $60.00 $127.00 $33.50

Meds Sodium Bicarbonate 8.4% Pre-filled 50ml luer lock $9.75 $10.74/EA No Bid $9.80 $35.01 $13.00

Meds 
SOLU-MEDROL 125mg Act-o-vial $10.66 $11.95/EA No Bid $10.00 $37.69 $12.00

Meds Tetracaine 0.5% ophthalmic 15ml monodrop bottle $6.92 $8.40/EA No Bid $11.20 $6.48 $9.50

Meds 0.9% Sodium Chloride  3ml ampules $11.75 $0.09/EA No Bid No Bid $9.00 $13.20

Meds Chewable Baby Aspirin 81mg $0.71 $1.90/BT $0.60 $0.89 $1.08 $0.77

Meds 5% Dextrose Injection USP 100 ml No bid $7.39/PK No Bid No Bid $659.20 $10.90

Meds Geodon 20mg/ml vials $560.00 $569.00/BX No Bid $510.00 - No Bid

Meds Sterile Water 10ml vials $25.30 $1.07/EA No Bid $28.50 $22.25 $1.10

Meds Zofran 4mg/2ml vials $12.99 $0.52/EA No Bid $0.60 $8.25 $0.54

Meds Ketamine 500mg/5ml vials No bid $44.61/BX No Bid $150.00 $275.10 $102.50

Airway Airway,Berman oral color coded 40mm $0.22 $0.45/PK $0.13 $0.19 $0.28 $0.08

Airway Airway,Berman oral color coded 50mm $0.22 $0.45/PK $0.13 $0.19 $0.28 $0.08

Airway Airway,Berman oral color coded 60mm $0.22 $0.45/PK $0.13 $0.19 $0.28 $0.08

Airway Airway,Berman oral color coded 70mm $0.22 $0.55/PK $0.13 $0.19 $0.27 $0.10

Airway Airway,Berman oral color coded 80mm $0.22 $0.55/PK $0.13 $0.19 $0.28 $0.10

Airway Airway,Berman oral color coded 90mm $0.22 $0.55/PK $0.13 $0.19 $0.28 $0.11

Airway Airway,Berman oral color coded 100mm $0.22 $0.66/PK $0.13 $0.19 $0.27 $0.13

Airway Airway,Berman oral color coded 110mm $0.22 $0.66/PK $0.13 $0.19 $0.15 $0.13

Airway Airway, nasopharyngeal plastic 12Fr $2.10 $2.24/EA $2.11 $2.25 $1.93 $1.07

Airway Airway, nasopharyngeal plastic 14Fr $2.10 $2.24/EA $2.11 $2.25 $1.77 $2.19

Airway Airway, nasopharyngeal plastic 16Fr $2.10 $2.24/EA $2.11 $2.25 $2.23 $2.19

Airway Airway, nasopharyngeal plastic 18Fr $2.10 $2.24/EA $2.11 $2.25 $1.81 $2.19

Airway Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 20Fr $2.00 $2.24/EA $16.66 $2.25 $2.09 $2.10

Airway Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 22Fr $2.00 $2.24/EA $16.66 $2.25 $2.42 $2.10

Airway Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 24Fr $2.00 $2.24/EA $16.66 $2.25 $1.93 $2.10



Airway Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 26Fr $2.00 $2.24/EA $16.66 $2.25 $2.04 $2.10

Airway Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 28Fr $2.00 $2.24/EA $16.66 $2.25 $2.37 $2.10

Airway Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 30Fr $2.00 $2.24/EA $16.66 $2.25 $1.91 $2.10

Airway Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 32Fr $2.00 $2.24/EA $16.66 $2.25 $1.83 $2.10

Airway Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 34Fr $2.00 $2.24/EA $16.66 $2.25 $1.55 $2.10

Airway Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 36Fr $2.00 $2.24/EA $16.66 $2.25 $1.88 $2.10

Airway Airway, Robertazzi Nasal Airway Kit $18.03 $24.46/PK $32.88 $16.00 $14.10 $17.50

Airway Bulb syringe 2oz-3oz $0.85 $0.25/EA $0.33 $0.89 $0.68 $0.50

Airway BVM, Adult Adult $24.57 $9.89/EA $54.25 $12.40 - $12.00

Airway BVM, Child Child No bid $9.62/EA $54.25 $15.90 - $12.00

Airway BVM, Infant Infant No bid $9.62/EA $54.25 $24.50 - $14.00

Airway ET Tube 2.0mm uncuffed $1.50 $0.50/EA $4.70 No Bid $0.82 $0.46

Airway ET Tube 2.5mm uncuffed $1.50 $0.50/EA $0.47 $1.65 $0.81 $0.46

Airway ET Tube 3.0mm uncuffed $1.50 $0.50/EA $0.47 $1.65 $0.83 $0.46

Airway ET Tube 3.5mm uncuffed $1.50 $0.50/EA $0.47 $1.65 $0.82 $0.46

Airway ET Tube 4.0mm uncuffed $1.50 $0.50/EA $0.47 $1.65 $0.82 $0.46

Airway ET Tube 4.5mm uncuffed $1.50 $0.50/EA $0.47 $1.65 $0.82 $0.46

Airway ET Tube 5.0mm $1.50 $0.69/EA $0.67 $1.85 $0.85 $0.46

Airway ET Tube 5.5mm $1.50 $0.69/EA $0.67 $1.85 $0.84 $0.46

Airway ET Tube 6.0mm $1.50 $0.69/EA $0.67 $1.85 $0.86 $0.46

Airway ET Tube 6.5mm $1.50 $0.69/EA $0.67 $1.85 $0.86 $0.64

Airway ET Tube W/stylette 7.0mm Flexi-set $3.39 $0.69/EA $1.35 $3.20 $3.44 $1.64

Airway ET Tube W/stylette 7.5mm Flexi-set $3.39 $0.69/EA $1.35 $3.20 $3.33 $1.64

Airway ET Tube W/stylette 8.0mm Flexi-set $3.39 $0.69/EA $1.35 $3.20 $41.10 $1.64

Airway ET Tube W/stylette 8.5mm Flexi-set $3.39 $0.69/EA $1.35 $3.20 $4.16 $1.64

Airway ET Tube Peds stylette 6Fr $2.70 $0.93/EA $26.66 $2.80 $1.24 $0.86

Airway ET Tube Adult stylette 12Fr $2.10 $1.90/EA $26.66 $1.95 $1.35 $1.73

Airway ET Tube Holder - Thomas Peds $2.60 $2.71/EA $2.65 $2.85 $2.49 $2.70

Airway ET Tube Holder - Thomas Adult $24.57 $2.71/EA $2.65 $2.85 $2.48 $2.70

Airway Quicktrach Peds $2.60 $115.05/EA $126.59 $135.00 $169.00 $130.00

Airway Quicktrach Adult $24.57 $134.59/EA $126.59 $135.00 $169.00 $130.00

Airway Combitube 41Fr Rollup Kit $41.00 $43.49/EA $40.96 $40.75 $39.75 $40.00

Airway Esophageal intubation detector Bulb model $2.51 $1.99/EA $42.28 $2.40 $2.00 $2.05

Airway CO2 Detectors 30mm I.D. No bid $9.36/EA No Bid No Bid $85.08 $10.88

Airway Emergency Pneumothorax set $139.93 $87.00/EA $91.93 $105.00 $195.00 $112.50

Airway Lubricating jelly foil packets $4.56 $8.99/BX $5.66 $0.05 $5.76 $5.95

Airway  Laryngoscope handle Medium - fiber optic $65.40 $180.21/BX $29.35 $62.00 $23.14 $45.10

Airway Laryngoscope handle Penlight - fiber optic $65.40 $103.58/EA $29.35 $62.00 $19.02 $45.10

Airway Replacement Bulbs No bid $12.10/EA $8.81 $12.80 $165.61 $9.10

Airway Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable Mac 4-Greenline fiberoptic $5.50 $3.55/EA $3.22 $5.42 $4.19 $3.50

Airway Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable Mac 3-Greenline fiberoptic $5.50 $3.55/EA $3.22 $5.42 $4.19 $3.50

Airway Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable Mac 2-Greenline fiberoptic $5.50 $3.55/EA $3.22 $5.42 $4.21 $3.50

Airway Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable Miller 0-Greenline fiberoptic $5.50 $3.55/EA $3.22 $5.42 $4.22 $3.50

Airway Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable Miller 1-Greenline fiberoptic $5.50 $3.55/EA $3.22 $5.42 $4.17 $3.50



Airway Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable Miller 2-Greenline fiberoptic $5.50 $3.55/EA $3.22 $5.42 $4.21 $3.50

Airway Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable Miller 3-Greenline fiberoptic $5.50 $3.55/EA $3.22 $5.42 $4.24 $3.50

Airway Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable Miller 4-Greenline fiberoptic $5.50 $3.55/EA $3.22 $5.42 $4.19 $3.50

Airway Suction Canisters 1200cc $2.90 $2.72/EA $2.61 $2.80 $2.46 $2.95

Airway Suction Canisters 800cc $2.53 $2.69/EA $1.81 $272.00 $2.08 $2.45

Airway Suction connecting tubing 1/4" x 6'-10' $0.77 $0.60/EA $0.62 $0.75 $0.64 $0.66

Airway Suction tip HI-D big stick $1.71 $1.79/EA $69.44 $1.95 $1.60 $1.78

Airway Suction tip Yankauer-open tip $42.23 $0.35/EA $0.34 $0.76 $0.51 $0.35

Airway Suction catheter 8 Fr $0.40 $0.13/EA $0.17 $0.24 $0.19 $0.12

Airway Suction catheter 12 Fr $0.35 $0.13/EA $0.17 $0.24 $0.19 $0.12

Airway Suction catheter 18 Fr $0.35 $0.13/EA $0.17 $0.24 $0.18 $0.12

Airway V-Vac Manual suction unit $80.56 $85.39/EA $85.78 $83.50 $75.46 $82.00

Airway V-Vac Replacement Cartridges $19.67 $20.99/EA $20.57 $21.70 $18.50 $21.50

Airway V-Vac Adapter tips $24.21 $25.89/PK $25.41 $28.50 $22.72 $25.80

Airway V-Vac Catheters $11.67 $12.42/PK $12.26 $13.20 $10.92 $12.45

Airway V-Vac Male Connectors $5.21 $5.54/PK $5.55 No Bid $5.00 $5.52

Airway MAD Mucosal Atomization Device $5.30 $5.95/EA $5.40 $5.67 $4.90 $5.45

Bandaging Comforming Stretch Bandage 4" non-sterile $2.05 $1.34/bx $1.38 $2.00 $0.84 $1.48

Bandaging Comforming Stretch Bandage 6" non-sterile $2.25 $1.36/BX $1.32 $2.20 $0.66 $1.48

Bandaging I.V. Sponges-sterile 2" x 2" $1.00 $0.86/BX $46.61 $0.80 $1.00 $0.84

Bandaging Gauze pad-sterile 4" x 4" $6.37 $5.63/BX $5.25 $74.00 $5.00 $5.60

Bandaging Gauze pad-sterile 8"x 10" No bid $3.57/TR $3.19 $0.17 $2.20 $3.40

Bandaging Vaseline Gauze 3' x 9" $28.85 $0.63/EA $0.59 $0.78 $0.56 $6.20

Bandaging Vaseline Gauze 3" x 18" $4.81 $0.78/EA $0.73 $0.93 $0.68 $9.13

Bandaging Multi Trauma Dressing 12" x 30" $0.38 $0.85/EA $0.75 $0.89 $0.80 $0.93

Bandaging Trianglar Bandages $0.23 $0.19/EA $0.19 $0.32 $0.27 $2.10

Bandaging Flexible Fabric Bandages 1" x 3" $1.35 $1.37/BX $1.53 $2.40 $2.00 $1.85

Bandaging Transpore Transparent Tape 1" x 10 yd $13.41 $14.92/BX $10.21 $1.26 $8.04 $14.50

Bandaging Transpore Transparent Tape 2" x 10yd $13.41 $14.92/BX $10.21 $2.52 $8.82 $14.50

Bandaging Micropore Paper Tape 1/2" x 10yd $7.09 $7.89/BX $5.32 $81.60 $5.52 $7.69

Bandaging Micropore Paper Tape 1" x 10yd $7.09 $7.89/BX $5.32 $0.68 $6.36 $7.68

Bandaging Cohesive Bandage 2" x 5yd $2.94 $0.61/EA $21.33 $0.65 $0.30 $0.67

Bandaging Economy Cold Packs 6" x 8" $0.30 $0.17/EA $9.36 $0.40 $4.32 $0.28

Bandaging Economy Hot Packs 6" x 8" $0.30 $0.29/EA $13.57 $0.60 $6.24 $0.37

Bandaging Sterile burn sheet 60" x 96" $1.90 $1.86/EA $1.64 $2.35 $0.97 $2.01

Bandaging O.B. Kit - soft pack $4.50 $4.44/EA $4.73 $6.10 $5.55 $4.95

Bandaging Ammonia Inhalants $2.00 $3.26/BX $1.86 $2.80 $1.80 $1.35

Bandaging Providone Iodine ampules No bid $1.91/EA No Bid $0.12 $840.00 $2.99

Bandaging Nail polish remover pads $3.32 $3.74/BX $3.67 $4.20 $4.00 $3.73

Bandaging Nose clips- bloody noses No bid $0.25/EA $0.25 $0.34 $20.00 $0.25

Bandaging Isopropyl Alcohol Pint $1.16 $1.73/EA $1.18 $1.85 $1.32 $1.17

Bandaging Hydrogen Peroxide Pint $1.16 $0.89/EA $0.55 $0.95 $0.35 $0.55

Bandaging Fabric bandages- spot Spot $3.73 $6.58/BX $1.51 $1.50 $1.00 $1.60

Bandaging Mylar Rescue Emergency blanket $0.40 $0.43/EA $0.43 $1.60 $0.43 $0.43



Bandaging Quickclot Hemostatic sponges $23.75 $36.95/EA No Bid $22.90 $14.75 No Bid

Bandaging Quickclot Combat Dressing 3" x 4 yds $32.99 $22.79/BG No Bid $32.20 $31.46 $32.00

Bandaging SOF-T Torniquette $21.51 $23.61/EA $24.46 $22.90 $24.28 $22.00

Diagnostic Blood pressure cuff Large Adult $7.00 $6.45/EA $4.99 $10.60 $5.97 $6.00

Diagnostic Blood pressure cuff Adult $7.00 $5.29/EA $4.83 $5.60 $5.63 $4.92

Diagnostic Blood pressure cuff Child $7.00 $5.13/EA $4.83 $8.60 $5.60 $4.75

Diagnostic Blood pressure cuff Infant $7.00 $5.13/EA $4.83 $7.85 $5.59 $4.75

Diagnostic Replacement Gauges for B/P Cuff No bid $5.86/EA $7.18 $7.95 $4.14 No Bid

Diagnostic Stethoscope Classic II S.E. Adult $66.11 $71.79/EA $67.60 $66.50 $61.45 $70.15

Diagnostic Stethoscope Classic II S.E. Peds $78.83 $85.61/EA $80.62 $81.00 - $83.85

Diagnostic Pro 4000  Tympanic Thermometer $200.00 $211.16/EA $198.33 $190.00 $196.87 $210.00

Diagnostic Pro 4000  Tympanic Probe Covers $12.37 $13.58/BX $12.65 $13.60 $14.00 $13.38

Diagnostic Disposable Penlights $3.50 $4.08/PK $0.55 $0.82 $4.14 $3.65

Diagnostic 3m Red Dot Repositionable Electrodes $205.49 $221.00/CS $1.06 $198.00 $220.00 $214.00

Diagnostic MRx Defib pads-plug style                NOT BARREL STYLEAdult No bid $30.47/PR No Bid $212.00 $239.40 $19.99

Diagnostic MRx Defib pads-plug style                                                NOT BARREL STYLEPeds No bid $16.92/PR No Bid $115.00 $109.65 $22.00

Diagnostic FRx Defib pads Adult/Peds $32.94 $33.56/ST No Bid $38.20 $35.12 $32.90

Diagnostic MRx Defib EKG Papper $26.47 $1.39/RL $1.49 $48.00 $47.00 $47.00

Diagnostic Trama Utility Shears $0.75 $0.77/PR $0.69 $0.95 $0.79 $0.64

Diagnostic Prep Razors-Disposable $0.06 $0.37/EA $15.33 $19.50 $16.00 $0.36

Diagnostic  Glocose monitor $9.25 $6.95/EANo Charge w/strip award$0.00 $15.84 $0.00

Diagnostic  Glocose monitor strips $14.44 $10.26/BX $9.09 $12.75 $15.00 $17.00

Diagnostic Unistik 2 Safty Lancets $16.00 $27.45/BX $15.62 $16.80 - $16.50

Diagnostic Lifpak 500 Quick-combo Defib pads Adult No bid $14.43/PR $24.90 No Bid $22.21 No Bid

Diagnostic Lifpak 500 Peds defib pads Peds/Infant No bid $62.73/PR $76.30 No Bid $16.66 $62.50

Diagnostic Nonin - Disposable sensor Adult No bid $10.32/EA $146.05 $10.10 $293.76 $10.10

Diagnostic Nonin - Disposable sensor Peds No bid $10.32/EA $146.05 $10.10 $12.23 $10.10

Diagnostic Nonin - Disposable sensor Infant No bid $10.32/EA $146.05 $10.10 $293.76 $10.10

Diagnostic Nonin - Disposable sensor Neonate No bid $10.32/EA $146.05 $10.10 $294.24 $10.10

Diagnostic Nellcor - Disposable sensor Adult $15.00 $7.30/EA $146.05 $16.30 $12.66 $7.25

Diagnostic Nellcor - Disposable sensor Peds $15.00 $7.30/EA $146.05 $16.30 $12.73 $7.25

Diagnostic Nellcor - Disposable sensor Infant $19.85 $7.30/EA $146.05 $21.20 $16.68 $7.25

Diagnostic Nellcor - Disposable sensor Neonate $17.25 $7.30/EA $146.05 $21.20 $16.90 $7.25

Diagnostic Leads Out Elctrode d-fib pads Adult No bid $18.77/PR No Bid No Bid $14.23 $17.25

Diagnostic Filter line set Adult $10.07 $7.60/EA $390.22 $9.12 $265.25 $7.50

Diagnostic Smart Capnoline plus Adult $14.49 $9.55/EA $561.23 $350.00 $381.50 $9.00

Breathing Aluminum Jumbo D Oxygen Cylinder W/ToggleJumbo D $78.07 $78.06/EA $79.29 $76.50 $73.83 $75.15

Breathing O2 NRB Mask Adult $1.06 $0.71/EA $0.61 $0.68 $0.67 $0.66

Breathing O2 NRB Mask Peds $1.29 $0.71/EA $0.64 $0.88 $0.92 $0.66

Breathing O2 NRB Mask Infant $0.80 $0.95/EA $0.82 $0.74 $4.15 $0.89

Breathing Nasal Cannula Adult $0.26 $0.26/EA $0.24 $0.30 $9.00 $0.25

Breathing Nasal Cannula Peds $0.38 $0.26/EA $0.35 $0.58 $9.00 $0.25

Breathing Tracheostomy mask Adult $1.00 $0.95/EA $32.22 No Bid $1.11 $1.30

Breathing Misty Max Nebulizer- Hand Held Adult $45.00 $0.73/EA $0.92 $0.96 $0.66 $1.01



Breathing Misty Max Nebulizer-Fase Mask Adult No bid $1.24/EA $1.34 $70.50 $0.97 $1.47

Breathing Misty Max Nebulizer-Fase Mask Peds No bid $1.89/EA $1.55 $83.50 $1.43 $1.54

Breathing Pocket Mask-Hard case $3.33 $2.56/EA $2.97 $3.80 $3.74 $2.32

Breathing Oxygen Supply Tubing $0.28 $0.28/EA $0.22 $0.48 $0.26 $0.22

Breathing Flow safe disposable CPAP $272.00 $37.28/EA No Bid $41.80 - $55.00

Breathing InLine Nebulizer small volume kit $191.11 $3.81/EA $0.84 $35.00 $3.05 $2.75

Immobilization Stifneck select collar Adult $24.57 $3.92/EA $5.77 $3.70 $4.97 $4.75

Immobilization Stifneck select collar Ped-select $5.16 $3.92/EA $5.77 $3.70 $4.53 $4.75

Immobilization Multi-grip Head Immobilizer-DisposableAdult $24.57 $4.31/EA $3.29 $4.05 $3.70 $3.15

Immobilization Prosplint Combo Splint $23.89 $22.62/EA $23.26 $23.80 $18.53 $13.60

Immobilization Prosplint Full leg Small $30.94 $27.74/EA $31.00 $31.70 $25.07 $26.99

Immobilization Prosplint Full leg Large $36.88 $31.74/EA $36.98 $37.80 $29.03 $31.00

Immobilization Prosplint Arm Small $17.38 $14.67/EA $16.94 $17.30 $13.41 $14.70

Immobilization Prosplint Wrist/forearm $17.38 $8.71/EA $10.38 $10.60 $8.34 $8.80

Immobilization Prosplint Replacement Carry Bag $33.02 $16.28/EA No Bid $32.90 $28.13 $30.00

Infection cntrl Adult wash cloth-disposable 12x8 $58.74 $236.00/CS $1.35 $1.90 $15.00 $1.62

Infection Cntrl Sani-Cloth HB 6" x 6 3/4" $5.68 $6.02/TB $5.74 $73.00 $6.40 $5.95

Infection Cntrl Synetron Latex Gloves XL $11.50 $9.59/BX $118.00 $87.00 $11.50 $10.88

Infection Cntrl Synetron Latex Gloves Large $11.50 $9.59/BX $118.00 $87.00 $11.50 $10.88

Infection Cntrl Synetron Latex Gloves Med $11.50 $9.59/BX $118.00 $87.00 $11.50 $10.88

Infection Cntrl Synetron Latex Gloves Small $11.50 $9.59/BX $118.00 $87.00 $11.50 $10.88

Infection Cntrl Safegrip Latex Gloves XL $12.00 $9.65/BX $12.63 $108.00 $13.00 $12.60

Infection Cntrl Safegrip Latex Gloves Large $12.00 $9.65/BX $12.63 $108.00 $13.00 $12.60

Infection Cntrl Safegrip Latex Gloves Med $12.00 $9.65/BX $12.63 $108.00 $13.00 $12.60

Infection Cntrl Safegrip Latex Gloves Small $12.00 $9.65/BX $12.63 $108.00 $13.00 $12.60

Infection Cntrl Supreno SE XL $9.00 $7.48/BX $94.50 $90.00 $10.00 $9.65

Infection Cntrl Supreno SE Large $9.00 $7.48/BX $94.50 $90.00 $10.00 $9.65

Infection Cntrl Supreno SE Med $9.00 $7.48/BX $94.50 $90.00 $10.00 $9.65

Infection Cntrl Supreno SE Small $9.00 $7.48/BX $94.50 $90.00 $10.00 $9.65

Infection Cntrl Hand Sanitizer 4 oz $1.13 $0.97/EA $0.55 $1.22 $0.88 $1.39

Infection Cntrl Hand Sanitizer 12 oz pump $4.36 $4.66/EA $4.10 $2.20 $2.83 $4.55

Infection Cntrl Bio Hazard Bags 10-15 Gal $8.00 $71.46/CS $59.89 $0.12 $35.00 $3.77

Infection Cntrl Bio Hazard Spill Kit $2.50 $3.41/EA $97.92 $3.15 $3.40 $3.97

Infection Cntrl Safety Eye Glasses $0.80 $0.98/EA $2.89 $1.10 $0.88 $1.37

Infection Cntrl N95 Respirator $14.51 $18.70/BX $121.05 $135.00 $23.20 $14.68

Infection Cntrl N95 Respirator $17.24 $18.47/BX $16.02 $0.95 $14.80 $17.70

Infection Cntrl Faceshield Mask w/Visor $28.06 $21.63/BX $17.08 $1.30 $6.75 $25.50

Infection Cntrl Securegard Face Mask No bid $0.05/EA $2.68 $0.32 $4.50 $2.17

Infection Cntrl Molded Surgical Mask $4.05 $0.69/EA $69.04 $95.00 $3.00 $4.45

Infection Cntrl Disposable Earplugs $19.33 $23.99/BX No Bid $0.10 $26.00 $15.50

Infection Cntrl Sharp-A-Gator Sharps Container 1 Quart $1.64 $1.71/EA $1.62 $1.90 $1.51 $1.69

Infection Cntrl In Room Sharps Cantainer W/Mailbox lid2 Quart $2.96 $3.05/EA $2.92 $3.50 $53.40 $2.10

Infection Cntrl In Room Sharps Cantainer W/Mailbox lid5 Quart $3.37 $4.15/EA $3.83 $3.40 $3.56 $2.70

Infection Cntrl Sharps container 8 Quart $3.12 $3.39/EA $3.15 $3.60 $4.52 $3.27



Infection Cntrl Sharps Shuttle $1.50 $1.35/EA $1.38 $3.55 $1.28 $1.60

Infection Cntrl Convenience Bags $9.30 $11.76/PK $10.00 $0.98 $0.86 $10.75

Infection Cntrl Disposable Emergency Blanket 56" x 90" No bid $1.74/EA $58.33 No Bid $3.46 $1.85

Infection Cntrl Sudecon Decontamination Wipes No bid $1.27/EA No Bid $1.55 $1.60 $1.50

Infection Cntrl Deluxe Infection Control kit $3.51 $1.94/EA No Bid $2.25 $4.05 $4.22

Infection Cntrl cot chucks 23" x 21" No bid $0.15/EA No Bid $37.75 $22.00 $4.30

Misc ALS Field Guide $22.39 $20.94/EA $22.48 No Bid $15.57 $19.50

Misc O2 Regultor/Bottle Gasket metal/rubber $1.02 $0.41/EA $23.80 $0.55 $3.15 $0.41

Misc Window punch $3.95 $4.31/EA $4.97 $4.95 $4.12 $3.42

Misc EKG Calipers $7.75 $3.57/EA $4.32 $3.80 $3.85 $3.50

Misc First Call-in Bag No bid $50.28/EA No Bid No Bid - $44.00

Misc Glove Butler/Holder $1.93 $5.35/EA $22.43 No Bid $19.74 $22.45

Misc Twist Loks $17.24 $17.23/BX $16.27 No Bid $14.00 $15.00

Misc Ready-Heat Blanket 34" x 48" $15.50 $16.63/EA $152.42 $15.80 $15.86 $15.80

Exam Room Instant Cold Packs  4'' x 5'' Single Use Cold Packs $2.00 $0.33/EA $9.36 $0.40 $7.50 $0.19

Exam Room Temporal Disposable Caps 1,000 caps/box $63.71 $75.00/BX $66.36 $74.50 $14.00 No Bid

Exam Room Surgilube Sterile bacteriostatic; 4 1/4 oz. each$3.57 $2.28/EA $2.90 $1.30 $32.40 $1.18

Exam Room Chux Pads (Underpads) 17'' x 24'' Disposable Underpad $18.54 $30.97/CS $20.35 $33.00 $12.00 $2.90

Exam Room Tongue Depressors Non-Sterile, Regular 6'' $4.33 $5.16/BX $3.14 $6.50 $10.00 $3.65

Exam Room Plastic Cups 5oz $38.53 $1.79/PK $1.30 No Bid $30.00 $1.54

Exam Room Speculums Kleen Spec- Medium $40.62 $215.74/CS $41.00 No Bid $44.28 $1.08

Exam Room Speculums Kleen Spec- Small $40.62 $215.74/CS $41.00 No Bid $37.68 $1.08

Exam Room Cavi Wipes Towelettes $7.00 $28.13/BX $7.48 $7.45 $23.00 $7.90

Exam Room OB/GYN Applicators 50/8 inch $3.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.00 No Bid

Exam Room Sharps Container Stackable Cont. $1.10 $1.53/EA $2.73 $92.00 $3.56 No Bid

Exam Room Alcohol Preps *Webcol 2-ply medium $1.50 $1.63/BX $1.26 $1.80 $2.00 $1.55

Exam Room Gauze Pads 2x2 $2.57 $0.85/BX $1.03 $0.94 $2.00 $2.38

Exam Room Cotton-tipped Applicators 6-in applicator; Sterile $2.43 $2.42/BX $1.88 $2.80 $4.00 $2.60

Exam Room Exam Table Paper Premium Smooth Table paper, 18x 225 ft, $23.15 $23.59/CS $28.56 No Bid $11.04 $1.98

Exam Room Poly Towel 3 ply white 13x18 in $16.74 $0.05/EA $18.79 No Bid $25.00 $23.90

Exam Room Drape Sheet 2 ply white 40x48 in $14.29 $29.70/CS $12.27 No Bid $9.00 No Bid

Exam Room Bandaids-STAT Strip 1" x 3" Fabric $3.38 $1.71/BX $2.73 $1.80 $4.00 $34.00

Exam Room Gloves Small $11.50 $6.65/BX $4.32 $57.00 $3.50 $47.40

Exam Room Gloves Medium $1.30 $6.65/BX $4.32 $57.00 $3.50 $47.40

Exam Room Gloves Large $11.50 $6.65/BX $4.32 $57.00 $4.00 $47.40

Exam Room Gloves X-Large $4.00 $6.65/BX $4.32 $57.00 $4.00 $47.40

Exam Room Vagina Specula Sheaths Sheaths No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.00 No Bid

Exam Room Cotton Balls Medium, non-sterile $4.82 $5.91/BG $7.75 No Bid $40.00 $0.30

Exam Room Vanishpoint Syringe with Needle 25G X 5/8 $31.46 $59.95/BX $37.50 $39.00 $41.00 $108.00

Exam Room Vanishpoint Syringe with Needle 25G X 1 $31.46 $74.49/BX $300.00 $39.00 $38.00 $69.50

Exam Room Vanishpoint Syringe with Needle Tuberculin Syringe 27G X 1/2 cc $37.08 $74.49/BX $37.50 No Bid $444.00 No Bid

First Aid Tylenol APAP 325mg 250 packets $8.10 $4.35/BX $9.15 $6.25 $10.00 No Bid

First Aid First Aid Box IBU $10.92 $8.63/BX $15.70 $18.50 - No Bid

First Aid First Aid Box Butterfly Closures 3/8inch x 1 5/8 inch$2.13 $1.49/BX No Bid $1.25 $2.20 $1.49



First Aid First Aid Box Triple Antibiotic Ointment 144 packets$12.50 $11.10/BX $10.06 $11.50 $7.20 $11.50

First Aid First Aid Box Antiseptic Wipes $1.50 $4.29/BX $0.96 $0.64 $3.00 $1.65

Laboratory Tourniquets non-latex, stretch $8.22 $27.93/BX $16.60 $18.70 $8.00 $35.50

Laboratory 3ml Syringes Syringe With luer-lok tip $12.92 $0.08/EA $12.77 No Bid $3.00 $16.00

Laboratory Lancets Activated Lancets 1.5mm- W x 2-mm-D Blade$57.39 $61.63/BX $56.75 $61.20 $32.00 $62.00

Laboratory Auto Clave Bags Size 24x30, Clear No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.00 No Bid

Laboratory Dispsable Culture Tubes Borosilicate Glass 12x75mm $30.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.00 No Bid

Laboratory Specimen Container sterile, 4 oz. $14.42 $0.15/EA $87.50 $35.00 $13.50 $3.50

Laboratory Test Tube Tops Tainer Top Safety Closures $58.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.50 No Bid

Laboratory Speciman Hat Top Hat Speciman Collector $41.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.74 No Bid

Laboratory 10ml Luer lock Syringe 10ml syringes with luer-lok tip $12.50 $0.12/EA $5.75 $0.20 $5.00 $11.58

Laboratory Needles 21G x 1'' Multi sample blood collection needle (Green)$6.74 $16.53/BX No Bid No Bid $5.00 $6.75

Laboratory Needles 22G x 1.0'' Multi sample blood collection needle (Black)$6.74 $202.71/CS No Bid No Bid $6.00 $19.80

Laboratory Venipuncture Needle-Pro Device Needle Protection Device $4.97 No Bid $200.85 No Bid $100.00 No Bid

Laboratory Venoject Multi-Sample Luer Adapter Disposable adapter fits into standard infusion sets (Butterfly Needle)$19.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.00 No Bid

Laboratory Hydrion pH Paper Hydrion ph Paper 3.0-5.5 with Dispenser$13.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.19 No Bid

Laboratory Paper Tape hypoallergenic 1in x 10yd $7.09 $3.09/BX $3.55 $9.36 $4.08 $3.45

Laboratory Cover Glass # 1 0.13-0.17mm, 22x22mm $1.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.70 No Bid

Laboratory Microscope slides Frosted, 1mm, 3x1, Box/144 $4.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.16 No Bid

Laboratory BV Test Kit OSOM BVBLUE Test $171.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid $165.75 No Bid

Laboratory BV Control Test Kit OSOM BVBLUE Control  $13.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.67 No Bid

Laboratory Trich Test Kit OSOM Trichomonas Rapid Test $171.91 No Bid No Bid No Bid $165.44 No Bid

Laboratory Trich Control Test Kit OSOM Trichomonas Rapid Control $20.63 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.88 No Bid

Laboratory Safety Needles 20 G x 1'' $20.39 $18.73/BX No Bid $21.00 $20.00 $12.00

Laboratory Safety Needles 23 G X 1 1/2 '' $20.39 $18.73/BX No Bid $30.00 $20.00 No Bid

Laboratory Safety Needles 25 G x 5/8'' $20.39 $18.04/BX No Bid $15.00 $19.00 $0.30

Laboratory Safety Needles 25 G X 1'' $20.39 $18.04/BX No Bid $15.00 $20.00 $12.00

Laboratory Safety Winged Blood Collection Set 23 G x 3/4 ''  $40.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid $36.00 No Bid

Laboratory Infusion Winged Blood Collection for Luer Lock23 G x 3/4 '' $33.10 $313.72/CS No Bid No Bid $44.00 $10.50

Laboratory Pregnancy Tests $9.73 $9.81/EA $11.81 No Bid $9.75 $9.78

Pharmaceuticals Azithromycin 250mg 250mg #4 $2.89 $6.85/BX No Bid $150.00 $4.56 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Azithromycin 1gm I gram susp No bid $33.47/EA No Bid $39.00 $267.80 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Bicillin LA 1200mu 2ml #1 $1,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,586.50 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Ceftriaxone inj 250 mg #1 $12.35 No Bid No Bid $38.00 $3.56 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Clindaymycin 300mg 300mg #14 $31.02 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.40 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Doxycycline Caps 100mg #14 No bid $29.88/BT No Bid $39.50 $7.00 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Doxycycline Caps 100mg #20 No bid No Bid No Bid $39.50 $7.00 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Doxycycline Caps 100mg #28 No bid No Bid No Bid $39.50 $7.00 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Ery-Tabs 500mg 500mg #28 No bid $1,359.00/BT No Bid $1,220.00 $1,726.00 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Lidocaine HCL inj 1% MDV 50ml $2.30 $2.44/EA No Bid No Bid $49.25 $2.45

Pharmaceuticals Lidocaine HCL Jelly 0.02 $147.00 $6.47/EA No Bid $8.15 $163.50 $4.70

Pharmaceuticals Metronidazole tabs 500mg #14 No bid $65.59/BT No Bid $56.00 $7.50 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Metronidazole tabs 500mg #4 No bid No Bid No Bid $56.00 $7.50 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Permetherin 5% cream 60mg $20.64 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $38.91 No Bid



Pharmaceuticals Suprax 400 mg #1 400mg #1 $1,375.00 No Bid No Bid $255.00 $4,545.00 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Trichloroacetic Acid 85% Aqueous Solution $52.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $51.99 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Tubersol PPD - Skin Test $88.38 $91.93/EA No Bid $85.00 $79.93 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Medroxy Progesterone (Depo Provera) 150ml vial #1 $72.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,590.75 No Bid

Pharmaceuticals Plan B One-Step emergency contraception $40.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.60 No Bid

Harm Prevention Trojan Enz Condoms $4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.32 No Bid

Harm Prevention Lifestyles NON-LATEX Polyisoprene $450.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $110.88 No Bid

Harm Prevention Durex Performax Intense Lubricated Condoms No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid - No Bid

Harm Prevention Durex Intense Sensation No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid - No Bid

Harm Prevention Durex Pleasuremax Lubricated No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid - No Bid

Harm Prevention Aqua Lube 3ml Foils No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid - No Bid

Harm Prevention Trustex Assorted Flavored/Scented Latex Dental Dams No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid - No Bid

Harm Prevention Latex Finger Cots No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.20 $8.00

Harm Prevention Durex Extra Sensitive No bid No Bid No Bid No Bid - No Bid
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