EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET
Product Category: I.V. Products

All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B‘I(')RUE'\IIED Unit Cost Catalog Number
amx | X
Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters (14 Gauge x 1.75" |Becton Dickinson 381467 |50/bx NO BID | $105.00| $105.98( $127.50
4/bx X $105.00 | $105.98
Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters |16 Gauge x 1.16" [Becton Dickinson 381454|50/bx NO BID $127.50
12/bx X $108.00 | $100.55
Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters |18 Gauge x 1.16" |Becton Dickinson 381444[50/bx NO BID $127.50
24/bx X $108.00 | $100.55
Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters |20 Gauge x 1.16" [Becton Dickinson 381434|50/bx NO BID $127.50
10/bx X $114.90 | $100.55
Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters |22 Gauge x 1" |Becton Dickinson 381423|50/bx NO BID $127.50
8/bx X $105.00 | $100.55
Insyte Autoguard IV Catheters |24 Gauge x .75" |Becton Dickinson 381412[50/bx NO BID $127.50
150/cs X $14.56 | $10.64 | $13.86
Sodium Chloride 0.9% IV Bag  [1000ml Bag Baxter 2B1324X|14/cs NO BID
20/cs X $34.20 | $49.68 | $32.40
Sodium Chloride 0.9% IV Bag  |250ml Bag Baxter 2B1322(36/cs NO BID
10/cs X $14.16 | $15.52 | $14.16
Sodium Chloride 0.9% 1000m! bottle Case NO BID
10/cs X $18.94 | $15.36 | $19.44
Sodium Chloride 0.9% 500m| Bottle Case NO BID
20/bx X $49.00 | $52.85 | $55.00
Sodium Chloride 0.9% 10ml flushes 100/bx NO BID
20/ea X $0.50 $0.60 $0.54
Padded IV Boards 3"x9" Each NO BID
12/ea X $0.56 $0.58 $0.52
Padded IV Boards 3" x 18" Each NO BID
1500 X $1.93 | $1.05 | $0.21
Tourniquiets - Latex Each NO BID
10/pk X $1.83 $1.30 | $30.00
Tourniquiets - Latex-free Pkg NO BID
36/bx X $1.43 $1.90
Alcohol IV Prep Pads Medium Bx NO BID
20/ea X $1.95 $0.75 $1.96
Tegaderm IV Start kit Latex-free Each NO BID
12/ea X $14.50 $9.86
Infusurg-Disposible 1000ml Each NO BID
6/bx X $8.56 $8.85 | $12.00
Luer slip tip syringe W/ Needle |1cc TB 25g x 5/8" 100/bx NO BID
3/bx X $5.62 $5.60 $6.00
Luer lock syringe 3cc 100/bx NO BID




EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Category: I.V. Products

All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B‘I(')RUE'\IIED Unit Cost Catalog Number
2/bx X $10.60 | $10.35 [ $12.00
Luer lock syringe 5-6¢C 100/bx NO BID
1/bx X $11.70 | $10.65 | $13.52
Luer lock syringe 10-12cc 100/bx NO BID
1/bx X $14.99 | $14.75 | $16.85
Luer lock syringe 20-25¢cc 50/bx NO BID
1/bx X $11.45 | $11.05 | $15.25
Luer lock syringe 60cc 25/bx NO BID
4lbx X $3.43 | $2.80 | $4.81
Hypodermic Syringe Needles 18G x 1" 100/bx NO BID
4lbx X $3.43 | $2.80 | $4.92
Hypodermic Syringe Needles 22G x 1.5" 100/bx NO BID
3/bx X $3.43 $2.80 $8.74
Hypodermic Syringe Needles 25G x 1.5" 100/bx NO BID
2/bx X $10.60 | $15.45 | $0.31
Winged Infusion Set 25G x 3/4" 50/bx NO BID
4/pk X $15.25 | $15.20 | $17.87
Twist Loks Healthmark 5224-red|100/pk| NO BID
24/bx $30.60 | $37.60 | $31.00
Tegaderm transparent dressing (2 3/8" x 2 3/4" 3M 1624w|100/bx| NO BID
4/ea $33.40 | $61.50 | $81.00
Lg Tegaderm dressing 4" x 5" 3M 1626w|50/bx NO BID
12/ea $0.25 $0.10
Carpuijet Injector Each NO BID
50/ea $0.42 $0.47
Filter Straws Each NO BID
600 $142.00 $148.00
8" IV Extention w/ clave port 8" Amsino C944304|100/bx NO BID
2500/eal $272.65| $225.60 | $278.40
Selec-3 IV system Biomedix B32-102|48/bx NO BID
100/ea X $2.55 | $2.76 | $5.80
Y-Type blood tubing NO BID




EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Category: Medications/Drugs
All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

BOUND

Product Description Size Manufacturer  Manufacturer # Unit YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE TREE Unit Cost Catalog Number
. 16/
Adenocard/Adenosine Pre-filled 6mg luer lock Each ea X $23.50 | $47.95 $28.95
12/ea X $59.50 | $91.10 $57.99
Adenocard/Adenosine Pre-filled 12mg luer lock Each
10/ea X $3.30 $3.75
Albuterol Sulfate 20ml multi-use w/dropper Each
30/bx X $4.05 $4.65 $3.90 $3.45
Albuterol Sulfate 3ml unit dose vial 25/bx
20/ea X $10.00 | $11.42 $10.53
Amiodarone/Cordarone Pre-filled 150mg luer lock Each
24/ea X $9.00 | $11.98 | $9.80 $8.90
Amidate/Etomidate 20mg vial Each
3lea X $9.15 | $8.85 | $6.15 | $8.45
Amly Nitrate Capsules 12/bx
125/ea X $2.80 $1.99 $2.20
Atropine sulfate Pre-filled 1mg luer lock Each
25/ea X $1.05 | $1.09 $1.10
Benadryl/Diphehydramine 50mg vial Each
15/ea X $1.90 | $1.95 $1.97
Calcium Chloride 1000mg vial Each
12/ea X $31.95 | $2.05 $1.70
Cardizem/Diltiazem 25mg vial Each
20/ea X $3.05 [ $2.55 $2.79
25% Dextrose Pre-filled 2.5mg luer lock Each
200/ea X $3.05 | $2.18 $2.66
50% Dextrose Pre-filled 25mg luer lock Each
6lea X $389.95 $440.00
Diastat - rectal gel 10mg Accudial 2/bx
12/ea X $12.00 | $9.72 $10.50
Dopamine HCL / 5% Dextrose [250ml IV Bag- 400mg Each
10/bx X $81.75 | $73.00 | $15.00
DuoNeb Inhalation solution 3ml unit dose vial 30/bx
8/bx X $31.25 | $35.00 | $29.60 | $33.00
Epinephrine 1:1000 1mg ampules 25/bx
225/ea X $2.10 | $2.15 $2.30
Epinephrine 1:10,000 Pre-filled 1mg luer lock Each
24/ea X $13.85 | $20.25 | $46.10 | $9.74
Flumazenil/Romazicon 5ml 0.1mg/ml or 0.5mg/5ml Each
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60/ea X $124.95 $124.00
Glucagon kit 1mg vial/syringe kit Lilly #0383 Each

12/ea X $1.88 $3.10 $2.99
Labetalol 100mg vial Each

24/ea X $7.20 $7.85 $7.60
Lidocaine HCL / 5% dextrose  |2gram 0.8% 250ml bag Each

20/ea X $1.90 | $2.15 $2.10
Lidocaine HCL 2% Pre-filled 100mg luer lock Each

30/ea X $0.85 $0.65 $0.68
Magnesium sulfate 50% 1gram vial Each

40/ea X $17.00 | $15.60 $14.41
Nalaxone/Narcan Pre-filled 2mg luer lock Each

12/ea X $217.27 | $141.50 | $195.20 | $180.00
Nitrolingual spray 200 metered dose pump Each

12/ea X $39.00 | $9.75 $9.73
Nitroglycerine tablets 0.4mg sl tablets 25/bt

60/ea X $3.05 $2.35 $2.73
Sodium Bicarbonate 8.4% Pre-filled 50ml luer lock Each

30/ea X $5.80 $6.48 $6.40
SOLU-MEDROL 125mg Act-o-vial Upjohn Each

12/ea $3.50 $3.30 $3.15 $2.22
Tetracaine 0.5% ophthalmic 15ml monodrop bottle Each

4/bx $18.00 $16.00
0.9% Sodium Chloride 3ml ampules 100/bx

40/ea $1.00 $0.94 $0.67 $0.81
Chewable Baby Aspirin 81mg Bottle




EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Category: Airway Maintenance
All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit  YR/Total No Subs  Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE BOUND TREE Unit Cost Catalog Number

10/ea X $0.50 $0.16 $0.20 $0.16
Airway,Berman oral color coded 40mm Berman Each

10/ea X $0.50 $0.16 $0.20 $0.16
Airway,Berman oral color coded 50mm Berman Each

10/ea X $0.50 $0.16 $0.20 $0.16
Airway,Berman oral color coded 60mm Berman Each

10/ea X $0.50 $0.16 $0.20 $0.16
Airway,Berman oral color coded 70mm Berman Each

20/ea X $0.50 $0.16 $0.20 $0.16
Airway,Berman oral color coded 80mm Berman Each

30/ea X $0.50 $0.16 $0.20 $0.16
Airway,Berman oral color coded 90mm Berman Each

150/ea X $0.50 $0.16 $0.20 $0.16
Airway,Berman oral color coded 100mm Berman Each

100/ea X $0.50 $0.16 $0.20 $0.16
Airway,Berman oral color coded 110mm Berman Each

20/ea X $1.90 $2.18 $2.02 $2.19
Airway, nasopharyngeal plastic 12Fr Rusch Each

10/ea X $1.90 $2.18 $2.02 $2.19
Airway, nasopharyngeal plastic 14Fr Rusch Each

10/ea X $1.90 $2.18 $2.00 $2.19
Airway, nasopharyngeal plastic 16Fr Rusch Each

10/ea X $1.90 $2.18 $2.00 $2.19
Airway, nasopharyngeal plastic 18Fr Rusch Each

10/ea X $1.90 $2.13 $2.11 $2.18
Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 20Fr Rusch Each

10/ea X $1.90 $2.13 $2.11 $2.18
Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 22Fr Rusch Each

10/ea X $1.90 $2.13 $2.11 $2.18
Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 24Fr Rusch Each

10/ea X $1.90 $2.13 $2.11 $2.18
Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 26Fr Rusch Each

10/ea X $1.90 $2.13 $2.11 $2.18
Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 28Fr Rusch Each

20/ea X $1.90 $2.13 $2.11 $2.18
Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 30Fr Rusch Each

20/ea X $1.90 $2.13 $2.11 $2.18
Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 32Fr Rusch Each

30/ea X $1.90 $2.13 $2.11 $2.18
Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 34Fr Rusch Each

30/ea X $1.90 $2.13 $2.11 $2.18
Airway, Robertazzi Nasal 36Fr Rusch Each
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Product Category: Airway Maintenance
All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit  YR/Total No Subs  Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE BOUND TREE Unit Cost Catalog Number

4/ea X $18.95 $12.95 $18.40
Airway, Robertazzi Nasal Airway Kit Rusch Kit

12/ea X $0.48 $0.86 $0.80 $0.30
Bulb syringe 20z-30z Each

150/ea $12.25
BVM, Adult Adult Airflow 87-AF1140MB|Each

24/ea $12.25
BVM, Child Child Airflow 87-AF-2140B|Each

24/ea $12.25
BVM, Infant Infant Airflow 87-Af-3140B [Each

20/ea X $0.50 $0.73 $0.90
ET Tube 2.0mm uncuffed Rusch Each

20/ea X $0.50 $0.73 $1.07 $0.90
ET Tube 2.5mm uncuffed Rusch Each

20/ea X $0.50 $0.73 $1.07 $0.90
ET Tube 3.0mm uncuffed Rusch Each

20/ea X $0.50 $0.73 $1.07 $0.90
ET Tube 3.5mm uncuffed Rusch Each

20/ea X $0.50 $0.73 $1.07 $0.90
ET Tube 4.0mm uncuffed Rusch Each

30/ea X $0.50 $0.73 $1.07 $0.90
ET Tube 4.5mm uncuffed Rusch Each

30/ea X $0.50 $0.92 $1.13 $1.09
ET Tube 5.0mm Rusch Each

30/ea X $0.50 $0.92 $1.13 $1.09
ET Tube 5.5mm Rusch Each

20/ea X $0.60 $0.92 $1.13 $1.09
ET Tube 6.0mm Rusch Each

30/ea X $0.60 $0.92 $1.13 $1.09
ET Tube 6.5mm Rusch Each

40/ea X $3.60 $29.50 $33.20 $40.00
ET Tube W/stylette 7.0mm Flexi-set Rusch 10/Bx

100/ea X $3.60 $29.50 $33.20 $40.00
ET Tube W/stylette 7.5mm Flexi-set Rusch 10/Bx

20/ea X $3.60 $29.50 $33.20 $40.00
ET Tube W/stylette 8.0mm Flexi-set Rusch 10/Bx

20/ea X $3.60 $29.50 $33.20 $40.00
ET Tube W/stylette 8.5mm Flexi-set Rusch 10/Bx

20/ea $1.00 $1.61 $4.62 $2.10
ET Tube Peds stylette 6Fr Rusch Each

40/ea $1.30 $1.61 $5.20 $2.10
ET Tube Adult stylette 12Fr Rusch Each
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All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit  YR/Total No Subs  Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE BOUND TREE Unit Cost Catalog Number
25/ea X $3.18 $2.50 $2.55 $3.11
ET Tube Holder - Thomas Peds Laerdal Each
250/ea X $3.18 $2.50 $2.55 $3.11
ET Tube Holder - Thomas Adult Laerdal Each
4/ea X $133.80 $123.75 $119.77 $150.00
Quicktrach Peds Rusch Each
4/ea X $133.80 $123.75 $119.77 $150.00
Quicktrach Adult Rusch Each
30/ea $38.00 $44.59 $40.85 $47.15
Combitube 41Fr Rollup Kit Each
150/ea $2.57 $1.99 $2.32 $2.15
Esophageal intubation detector Bulb model Each
10/cs X $131.00
CO2 Detectors 30mm I.D. Fenem 10/cs
4lea $74.50 $91.40 $106.98 $95.76
Emergency Pneumothorax set COOK Each
2/bx X $8.95 $7.49 $3.72 $0.60
Lubricating jelly foil packets 144/bx
8lea X $45.90 $43.75 $47.27 $50.00
Laryngoscope handle Medium - fiber optic Sunmed Each
8lea X $45.90 $43.75 $50.00
Laryngoscope handle Penlight - fiber optic Sunmed Each
100/ea X $4.40 $3.46 $4.08 $3.94
Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable |Mac 4-Greenline fiberoptic |Sunmed Each
150/ea X $4.40 $3.46 $4.08 $3.94
Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable |Mac 3-Greenline fiberoptic [Sunmed Each
10/ea X $4.40 $3.46 $4.08 $3.94
Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable |Mac 2-Greenline fiberoptic |Sunmed Each
10/ea X $4.40 $3.46 $4.08 $3.94
Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable |Miller 0-Greenline fiberoptic |Sunmed Each
10/ea X $4.40 $3.46 $4.08 $3.94
Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable |Miller 1-Greenline fiberoptic |Sunmed Each
10/ea X $4.40 $3.46 $4.08 $3.94
Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable |Miller 2-Greenline fiberoptic |Sunmed Each
40/ea X $4.40 $3.46 $4.08 $3.94
Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable |Miller 3-Greenline fiberoptic |Sunmed Each
60/ea X $4.40 $3.46 $4.08 $3.94
Laryngoscope Blade -Disposable |Miller 4-Greenline fiberoptic |Sunmed Each
50/ea X $3.05 $2.61 $2.43 $4.00
Suction Canisters 1200cc Bemis 484410|Each
100/ea X $2.30 $2.18 $2.04 $2.69
Suction Canisters 800cc Bemis 424410|Each
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100/ea X $0.65 $0.55 $1.05 $0.87
Suction connecting tubing 1/4" x 6'-10' Each
50/ea X $1.60 $1.64 $1.42 $1.66
Suction tip HI-D big stick SSCOR Each
50/ea X $0.50 $0.62 $0.41 $0.60
Suction tip Yankauer-open tip Each
20/ea X $0.20 $0.28 $0.42 $0.23
Suction catheter 8 Fr Each
30/ea $0.20 $0.28 $0.35 $0.23
Suction catheter 12 Fr Each
10/ea $0.20 $0.28 $0.35 $0.23
Suction catheter 18 Fr Each
12/ea X $72.00 $76.10 $66.20 $84.86
V-Vac Manual suction unit Laerdal Each
20/ea X $16.70 $17.79 $15.49 $19.80
V-Vac Replacement Cartridges Laerdal Each
6lea X $20.00 $21.50 $18.75 $23.95
V-Vac Adapter tips Laerdal 4/pk
6/ea X $9.70 $10.30 $8.97 $11.46
V-Vac Catheters Laerdal 4/pk
6lea X $4.40 $4.69 $4.08 $5.21
V-Vac Male Connectors Laerdal 10/pk




EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Category: Bandaging
All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B_?Rlél\éD Unit Cost Catalog Number
. 10/

Comforming Stretch Bandage |4 non-sterile 96/cs “ X $1.24| $12.50| $12.48| $21.12
Comforming Stretch Bandage & non-sterile a8Jcs 10/cs X $1.20| $12.80| $13.60( $21.12

10/cs X $52.80( $46.20| $53.40
1.V. Sponges-sterile 2"x 2 Dukal 6122|**/cs

15/cs X $4.25| $57.00| $54.24| $58.80
Gauze pad-sterile 4" x 4" Dukal 1412|**/cs

6/cs X $3.25| $56.95| $52.64| $52.56
Gauze pad-sterile 8"x 10" **[og

4/bx X $7.70 $6.56| $28.53| $37.50
Vaseline Gauze 3'x9" Box

6/bx X $15.50 $9.65 $8.40| $11.40
Vaseline Gauze 3" x 18" Box

3/cs X $0.80| $56.87| $19.50( $59.00
Multi Trauma Dressing 12" x 30" 50/cs

4/cs X $0.21| $57.00| $60.00( $72.00
Trianglar Bandages Case

24/bx X $1.85 $1.78 $1.70| $2.20
Flexible Fabric Bandages 1"x 3" 100/bx

15/bx X $10.75( $10.95| $12.75| $15.00
Transpore Transparent Tape 1"x 10 yd 3M 15271[12/bx

4/bx X $10.75( $11.45| $12.75| $15.00
Transpore Transparent Tape 2" x 10yd 3M 15272|6/bx

6/bx X $6.52 $7.25 $6.30| $8.91
Micropore Paper Tape 1/2" x 10yd 3M 15300(24/bx

8/bx X $6.52 $7.25 $6.30| $8.91
Micropore Paper Tape 1" x 10yd 3M 15301 (12/bx

40/ea X $0.75 $0.72 $3.11| $0.80
Cohesive Bandage 2" x 5yd Each

50/cs X $10.25 $9.25| $10.32| $8.25
Economy Cold Packs 6" x 8" Case

20/cs X $10.25( $10.25( $11.04| $8.75
Economy Hot Packs 6" x 8" Case

24/ea X $3.05 $2.79 $2.75| $3.30
Sterile burn sheet 60" x 96" Each

12/ea X $6.10 $6.05 $4.79| $7.00
O.B. Kit - soft pack Each
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Product Category: Bandaging

All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit  YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B_?Rlél\éD Unit Cost Catalog Number
12/bx X $1.95| $1.85| $1.73| $1.89
Ammonia Inhalants 10/bx
8/bx X $1.95| $2.80| $14.20| $2.02
Providone lodine ampules 10/bx
8/bx X $3.40| $3.19| $2.47| $3.74
Nail polish remover pads 100/bx
100/ea X $3.00 $0.43
Nose clips- bloody noses Each
12/ea X $1.70| $1.35| $1.15| $2.00
Isopropyl Alcohol Pint Each
. 12/ea
Hydrogen Peroxide Pint Each X $0.90 $0.55 $0.62| $2.00
250/ea
Glutose 15 Single dose Each X $10.40| $3.70[ $8.56( $3.15
. 24/bx
Fabric bandages- spot Spot 100/bx X $1.20| $4.05| $3.40( $0.04
Mylar Rescue Emergency blanket Each 12/ea X $0.75 $0.69 $1.73| $0.55
Quickclot Hemostatic sponges Box 5/bx X $31.40( $23.80| $21.80| $24.81




EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Category: Immobilization/Splinting

All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B_I_ORUE'\:ED Unit Cost Catalog Number

llea X $75.00 | $296.50 $270.40
Ped Papoose Board Each

25/cs $430.00 | $247.50 | $258.00 | $265.00
Stifneck select collar Adult Laerdal 980011|50/cs

4/cs X $172.00 | $107.00 | $103.20 | $115.00
Stifneck select collar Ped-select Laerdal 980021|20/cs

6lea X $74.40 | $79.05 $59.98
Head Immobilizer Big Blue Each

6ela X $76.40 | $61.15 | $60.44 | $59.98
Head Immobilizer EMP/Moore 2002 / 66049 [Each

4lea X $19.00 | $12.20 | $10.44 | $17.98
Replacement Straps Set

8lea X $43.34 | $29.75 | $30.77 | $40.93
Replacement Base Pad Each

6lea X $44.85 | $14.35 | $30.77 | $43.56
Replacement Blocks Each
Multi-grip Head aes | X $4.11 |$231.50|$192.50| $4.50
Immobilizer-Disposable Adult I-Tec 101|50/cs

llea X $60.00 | $79.50 | $82.41 | $77.00
K.E.D. / Rescue Vest Each

12/ea | X $22.35 | $20.60 | $24.38 | $23.75
Prosplint Combo Splint Med Spec 113010/ PS11|Each

12/ea | X $29.80 | $28.10 | $26.90 | $32.00
Prosplint Full leg Small Med Spec 113032 / PS32|Each

eea | X $35.10 | $32.49 | $32.42 | $40.00
Prosplint Full leg Large Med Spec 113034 / PS34|Each

elea | X $16.25 | $14.95 | $18.67 | $19.00
Prosplint Arm Small Med Spec 113052 / PS52|Each

20ea | X $10.00 | $9.20 | $13.02 | $11.00
Prosplint Wrist/forearm Med Spec 113070 / PS70|Each

2lea | X $30.90 | $31.75 | $31.88 | $40.00
Prosplint Replacement Carry Bag Med Spec 113315 / PS15|Each




Product Category: Diagnostic Equipment
All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit  YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B_?ng\éD Unit Cost Catalog Number
2/ 11.67
Blood pressure cuff Large Adult Each e X $6.00 | $11.25 | ° $11.00
8lea X $8.95| $9.00
Blood pressure cuff Adult Each $6.00 | $11.25
2lea X $9.00
Blood pressure cuff Child Each $6.00 | $11.25 $8.85
l/ea X $8.85| $9.00
Blood pressure cuff Infant Each $6.00 | $11.25
6/ea X $80.40 | $70.85 $61.63| $87.24
Stethoscope Classic Il S.E. Adult 3m Littmann Each
4/ea X $95.25 | $83.95 $72.99| $98.68
Stethoscope Classic Il S.E. Peds 3m Littmann Each
4/ea X $171.00 | $181.10 | $157.50| $206.95
Pro 4000 Tympanic Thermometer Welch Allyn Each
20/cs X $13.20 | $13.95 $12.20| $16.95
Pro 4000 Tympanic Probe Covers 200/cs
24/pk X $3.75 $4.40 $3.52| $4.26
Disposable Penlights 6/pk
3m Red Dot Repositionable 12/cs X $270.50 | $233.75 $263.00
Electrodes 3M 2670-5/1000/cs
MRx Defib pads-plug style 200/set| X $18.00 | $23.20 $23.49
NOT BARREL STYLE Adult Phillips Set
MRx Defib pads-plug style 3oiset | X $18.00 | $25.60 $25.60
NOT BARREL STYLE Peds Phillips Set
30/set X $35.30 | $33.50 $34.95
FRx Defib pads Adult/Peds Phillips Set
20/pk X $1.15 $43.20 $7.00
MRx Defib EKG Papper Pk
. $1.16
Trama Utility Shears Each 20/ea $0.80 $0.99 $1.13
) $16.85
Prep Razors-Disposable Each 50/ea $17.12 $0.35 $0.37
Contour Glocose monitor Each 12/ea $0.00 | $76.00 | $65.22| $88.46
Contour Glocose monitor strips 50/pk 100 X $24.00 | $24.90 | $19.95
Unistik 2 Safty Lancets 100/bx | 20/bx $21.95 $12.77




EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Category: Diagnostic Equipment
All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit  YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B_?ng\éD Unit Cost Catalog Number
Lifpak 12 Quick-combo Defib pads  [Adult Medtronic 3008497-661  |Each 2area | X $30.24 | $28.50
Lifpak 500 Peds defib pads Peds/Infant Medtronic Each 12/ea X $93.20 | $95.50




EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Category: Breathing & Respiratory
All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B%UE’\:ED Unit Cost Catalog Number

Aluminum Jumbo D Oxygen slea
Cylinder W/Toggle Jumbo D Each X $70.00 | $69.95 | $60.99 | $112.00

40/cs X $31.00 | $47.50 | $48.50 | $43.00
02 NRB Mask Adult 50/cs

4fcs X $32.50 | $55.50 | $59.00 | $70.50
02 NRB Mask Peds 50/cs

2lcs X $37.50 | $110.00 | $104.50 | $100.00
02 NRB Mask Infant 50/cs

35/cs X $12.50 | $16.50 | $18.00 | $16.00
Nasal Cannula Adult 50/cs

2/cs X $13.50 | $24.68 | $31.60 | $28.50
Nasal Cannula Peds 50/cs

20/cs $49.00 | $50.65 $37.50
Misty Max Nebulizer- Hand Held Adult #002438|50/cs

8/cs $65.00 | $61.25 $49.00
Misty Max Nebulizer-Fase Mask Adult #002433|50/cs

2lcs $78.20 | $81.25 $49.00
Misty Max Nebulizer-Fase Mask Peds #002443|50/cs

15/ea X $3.60 | $4.36 | $3.53 | $5.00
Pocket Mask-Hard case Each

80/ea $99.50
Res-Q-pod 12-0242-000|Each

50/ea $268.00 | $245.00 $280.00
CPAP Wisper pak 4-100112-00|Case

2lcs X $18.30 | $15.35 | $16.50 | $13.00
Oxygen Supply Tubing 50/cs




EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Category: Infection Control / PPE

All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B‘I?R’UEI\IIED Unit Cost Catalog Number
24/tubs X $5.85 $5.84 $5.27 $9.22
Sani-Cloth HB 6" x 6 3/4" PDI Q08472|160/Tub|
25/cs X $8.40 | $75.25 | $72.20 | $93.80
Synetron Latex Gloves XL Microflex Case
22/cs X $8.40 | $75.25 | $72.20 | $93.80
Synetron Latex Gloves Large Microflex Case
15/cs X $8.40 | $75.25 | $72.20 | $98.80
Synetron Latex Gloves Med Microflex Case
12/cs X $8.40 | $75.25 | $72.20 | $98.80
Synetron Latex Gloves Small Microflex Case
25cs | X $9.25 | $84.95 [ $79.10 | $103.20
Safegrip Latex Gloves XL Microflex Case
12/cs X $9.25 | $84.95 | $79.10 | $103.20
Safegrip Latex Gloves Large Microflex Case
6les | X $9.25 | $84.95 [ $79.10 | $103.20
Safegrip Latex Gloves Med Microflex Case
5/cs X $9.25 | $84.95 | $79.10 | $103.20
Safegrip Latex Gloves Small Microflex Case
20/cs X $8.95 | $76.25 | $73.30 | $118.80
Supreno SE XL Microflex Case
40/cs X $8.95 | $76.25 | $73.30 | $118.80
Supreno SE Large Microflex Case
20/cs X $8.95 | $76.25 | $73.30 | $118.80
Supreno SE Med Microflex Case
4lcs X $8.95 | $76.25 | $7.33 |$118.80
Supreno SE Small Microflex bx
10/cs X $38.50 | $30.60 | $21.60 | $1.59
Hand Sanitizer 40z Case
12/cs X $1.40 $2.44 $1.41
Hand Sanitizer 8 0z pump Each
6/rolls X $2.57 | $8.10 | $5.64 | $0.47
Bio Hazard Bags 10-15 Gal Roll
12/Ea X $4.48 $4.36 $2.13 $5.37
Bio Hazard Spill Kit Each
30/ea X $1.00 | $1.37 | $0.79 | $1.68
Safety Eye Glasses Each




EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Category: Infection Control / PPE

All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B‘I?R’UE,\IIED Unit Cost Catalog Number
X $16.59 $55.90
N95 Respirator 8511 20/box
20kea | X $17.00 | $20.85 | $18.50 | $75.72
N95 Respirator 1860 50/box
4/Bx X $23.50 | $20.50 | $9.95 $23.00
Faceshield Mask w/Visor bx
20/bx X $26.25 | $5.60 $15.00
Securegard Face Mask bx
2/cs X $19.75 | $4.05 $90.00 | $79.60
Molded Surgical Mask cs
2/bx X $0.92 | $15.65 | $15.20 | $15.30
Disposable Earplugs bx
24/ea X $1.66 $1.73 $1.50 $1.35
Sharp-A-Gator Sharps Container |1 Quart Sage 8900|Each
In Room Sharps Cantainer l/cs $3.23 $3.23 $2.83 $3.30
W/Mailbox lid 2 Quart Sage Each
In Room Sharps Cantainer 1l/cs $4.00 $4.22 $3.71 $3.20
W/Mailbox lid 5 Quart Sage Each
24/ea X $3.23 $3.31 $2.88 $3.90
Sharps container 8 Quart Sage 8970|Each
1/bx $1.60 $1.65 $1.43 $1.77
Sharps Shuttle Sage Each
100/pk $1.05 $11.15 | $10.14 | $12.14
Convenience Bags 12/pk
12/ea $2.15 $0.69 $1.00
Disposable Emergency Blanket 56" x 90" Medsource MS-B300|Each
24/ea X $1.43 $0.99 $2.00
Sudecon Decontamination Wipes FI911|Each
24/ea $1.60 $4.38 $3.03 $6.00
Deluxe Infection Control kit 80522|Each
30/pks
cot chucks 23" x 21" Medsource MSC281225|12/pk $1.62 $4.40 $1.30
3/cs X
DepHyze Ultre Cleaner DEP08 fcs $127.99 $11.00




EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET

Product Category: Miscellaneous (Others)
All Quantities, based on 12-month usage

Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free PMI EMP MOORE B_I(_)RUEI\IIED Unit Cost Catalog Number

12/ea X $19.80 | $17.85 $19.90

ALS Field Guide Each
24/ea $1.00 $0.39 $0.89 $0.50

02 Regultor/Bottle Gasket metal/rubber Each
10/ea $4.30 $6.70 $7.50

02 Bottle toggle handle Each
10/ea $2.56 $2.50 $2.85 $7.00

Window punch Each
6/ea $4.33 $4.75 $3.50 $7.50

EKG Calipers Each
4lea $51.25 $54.90

02 Duffel L.A. rescue LA8490G|[Each
6/ea $36.95 $34.50

First Call-in Bag L.A. rescue FCB-RED|Each
24 X $17.60 | $10.10 $4.23

Glove Butler/Holder

Each
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