
Product Description Size Manufacturer Manufacturer # Unit YR/Total No Subs Or Equal Latex Free MOORE PROGRESSIVE AIRGAS EMP Unit Cost Catalog Number

ALS Field Guide Each
12/ea X $15.95 ea $20.57 ea NO BID $18.85 ea

O2 Regultor/Bottle Gasket metal/rubber Each
24/ea X $.95 ea $.50 ea $.73 ea $.38 ea

O2 Bottle toggle handle Each
10/ea X NO BID $4.55 cea $2.00 ea $6.50 ea

Window punch Each
10/ea X $2.95 ea $2.65 ea NO BID $2.75 ea

EKG Calipers Each
6/ea X $6.30 ea $4.55 ea NO BID $4.75 ea

O2 Duffel L.A. rescue LA8490G Each
4/ea X NO BID NO BID NO BID $51.25 ea

First Call-in Bag L.A. rescue FCB-RED Each
6/ea X NO BID NO BID NO BID $34.45 ea

Glove Butler/Holder 89250 Each
24 X NO BID $18.30 ea NO BID $10.05 ea

Twist Loks Healthmark 5224-red 100/pk
4/pk X $15.40 pk $18.95 pk NO BID $15.24 ea

Ready-Heat Blanket 34" x 48" G12RH2 24/Cs
X $14.75 ea $756.00 NO BID $16.50 ea

EMERGENCY MEDICAL (PARAMEDIC/EMT) AND FIRE BID-WORKSHEET
Product Category: Micellaneous (Others)
All Quantities, based on 12-month usage


	Miscellaneous (Other)

