Purchasing Department

Sam J. Alello, C.P.M. Purchasing Agent



City Hall 730 Washington Avenue Racine, Wisconsin 53403 (262) 636-9143 Fax: (262) 636-9100

To:

Honorable Members of Public Safety and Licensing Committee

From:

Sam J. Aiello

Purchasing Agent

Date:

November 25, 2008

Subject:

Recommendation for Award, Official Notice #12

Emergency Medical Supplies for the Racine Fire Department

Official Notice #12, Emergency Medical Supplies for the Racine Fire Department, was opened in the Office of the Purchasing Agent on November 14, 2008 at 10:00 A.M. local time. The four (4) responsive bidders were Bound Tree Medical, LLC, Emergency Medical Products, Inc. Moore Medical Products, and Cardinal Health.

The recommendation for award for the period starting January 1, 2009 through December 31, 2009 is by individual line item (shaded cells on spreadsheet attached) based on the following criteria:

1. Low bid per line item.

2. Lowest bid for a specific product if specified as no substitution allowed. No substitution items were specified because of the quality needed for certain items.

3. Some products are sole source; i.e., CPAP (continuous positive airway pressure) supplies are distributed only through Bound Tree Medical.

I was greatly assisted in making this award recommendation by Paramedic Driver/Operator Tim Lehner of the Racine Fire Department. His effort and expertise were invaluable to me in bringing this project to a successful conclusion.

Funding for this expense in FY2009 is \$96,200 in account 101.300.5690. The Fire Department has consistently stayed within budget regarding this account.

Respectfully, Submitted,

Sam J. Aiello
Purchasing Agent

Cc:

Chief Hansen

D/O Lehner

■ position emilion superiorality
200 C
100
140602.40.45
THE WORLD
\$10.00 (a)
\$10 March 2015 1
And the state of the state of
144 MAR / 1546 / 1
10/20/20/20
"我就是一个一个一
12.080 Park 1974 C
KSHEA
1,2
1 24 (Section 5)
18 7
15 ä
1 1 4
I≘" ∪
A CONTRACTOR
25 46 10 10 1
D 0 €
6 (5 (1 X)
14.54
2 2
1 H 8 8
₩ 6 7
7 9 5
1 2 2
X (* 6)
S -2
1 3 8 8
200
0 - D
To a
4
MEDI
MED
٥

E Unif Cost					-									
BOUND TREE Unit Cost	\$20.76	\$1.22	\$48.00	\$6.51	\$6.29	\$55.96	(5) (5) (6)	\$220.88	\$30.79	\$57.83	\$3. 1.20 2.30 2.30 3.30 3.30 3.30 3.30 3.30 3			
MOORE	NO BID	\$0.85	ONO BID	\$2.89	77 (63) (75)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID			
EMP	ଊ୳ଢ଼ୄଌୄଌ	\$6.60	\$6.85 \$	£2.66	\$4.75	<u> </u>	\$35.50	\$166.7₹	380.60	(9) (8) (9) (9)	\$9.95		_	
YR/Total No Subs On Equal Latex Free HEALTH	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	1		
Latex Free														
Or Equal	×		×	×	×						×			
No Subs		×	:			×	×	×	×	×			 	
YR/Total	12/ea	24/ea	10/ea	10/еа	e/ea	4/ea	6/ea	10/ea	2/ea	2/ea	24			
1 5	Each	Each	Each	Each	Each	G Each	D Each	B Each	B Each	#s400X Each	Each	<u> </u>		
Manufacturer#		:				LA8490G Each	FCB-RED Each	A1000XRB Each	LA4000RB Each	#s400				
Manufacturer						L.A. rescue	L.A. rescue	<u>,o</u>	L.A. rescue	<u>.</u> 2				
						LA	LA.	Pacific	L.A.	Pacific		_		
Size	:	metal/rubber												
Product Description	ALS Field Guide	O2 Regultor/Bottle Gasket	O2 Bottle toggle handle	Window punch	EKG Calipers	O2 Duffel	First Call-in Bag	Modular Medical O2 Kit	Intubation Kit	Intubation Kit	Glove Butter/Holder			