
Official Notice #2-2021 Razing
Raze

Receive bids:  
Monday, January 25, 2021 at 10:00am CST

======================================= ================== ====================== ================ ================ =============== =============
THIS IS NOT AN AWARD V Tech Mensching Enterprises Inc The MRD Group SRI LLC Macemon & Sons RLP Diversified
Lowest Bidder Highlighted in Yellow Union Grove, WI Elkhorn, WI W Milwaukee, WI Sturtevant, WI Caledonia, WI Burlington, WI 
Needs Council Approval

======================================= ================== ====================== ================ ================ =============== =============

ITEM DESCRIPTION TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST TOTAL COST

1 Raze 1124 Villa St No bid 89,500.00$                            65,700.00$               No bid 86,000.00$            65,000.00$        

2 Raze 1704 Center St 15,000.00$                    11,200.00$                            23,000.00$               8,900.00$                 19,125.00$            17,000.00$        
3 Raze 1108 Villa St 15,800.00$                    15,125.00$                            25,000.00$               8,900.00$                 23,000.00$            21,000.00$        
4 Raze 2117 Lawn St 24,500.00$                    16,200.00$                            30,000.00$               No bid 19,475.00$            19,000.00$        
5 Raze 1119 S. Memorial Dr. 8,900.00$                      11,500.00$                            27,000.00$               No bid 17,575.00$            16,000.00$        

This bid opportunity includes five (5) properties located in the City of Racine.
As such there will be a total of five (5) awards – one for each property.


